
Manalapan Twp. Police Dept. Press Releases 
June 11, 2025 – June 17, 2025 

Residents are reminded to remove any valuables from unoccupied 
vehicles and remember to lock your vehicle’s doors. 

***DO NOT LEAVE KEY FOBS IN VEHICLES! *** 
 
25MN20369 – Harassment 
 
On Tuesday, June 17th, 2025 at approximately 5:51 p.m., an 80-year-old 
Manalapan resident reported that they had received a harassing letter from an 
unknown actor. Patrolman Brandon Yeung handled this report.  
 
25MN20366 – Warrant Arrest 
 
On Tuesday, June 17th, 2025 at approximately 5:37 p.m., Patrolman Edward 
Burns conducted a motor vehicle stop on Pine Brook Road in Manalapan. The 
driver of the vehicle, identified as David Hill, a 48-year-old, unmarried, male 
resident of Elizabeth, NJ, who is employed as a construction worker, was found 
to have a warrant issued for his arrest by the Borough of Keyport Municipal Court 
in the amount of $1000.00.  Mr. Hill was placed under arrest and transported to 
Manalapan Township Police Headquarters where he was processed and 
released after posting bail, pending a future court date.  Patrolman Edward Burns 
was the arresting officer.  

 
25MN20214 – Terroristic Threats 
 
On Monday, June 16th, 2025, at approximately 3:34 p.m., a 57-year-old 
Manalapan resident reported that an unknown actor(s) sent them threatening text 
messages. Patrolman Matthew Jastrzembski handled the report.  
 
25MN20188 – Attempted Burglary / Motor Vehicle Theft 
 
On Monday, June 16th, 2025, at approximately 1:00 a.m., a 38-year-old 
Manalapan resident reported that unknown actor(s) attempted to gain access to 
their residence. Furthermore, it is believed the actor(s) gained access to their 
vehicle in an attempt to remove it from the driveway of their residence. No 
monetary loss at this time and the vehicle was not removed from the residence. 
Patrolman Donovan Turner handled the initial report.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
25MN20101 - Criminal Mischief 
 
On Sunday, June 15th, 2025 at approximately 12:15 p.m., a 67-year-old 
Manalapan resident reported that their garage door had appeared to be kicked 
twice. No entry was made to the garage. Patrolman Hope Barina handled the 
report.  
 
25MN19943 – Harassment 
 
On Friday, June 13th, 2025 at approximately 9:06 p.m., a 37-year-old Aberdeen 
resident reported ongoing workplace harassment at a business located within 
Manalapan Township. Patrolman Ryan Brady handled the report.  
 
25MN19935- Fraud 
 
On Friday, June 13th, 2025 at approximately 6:52 p.m., a Marlboro resident 
reported that a contractor fraudulently used their deposit for purposes not related 
to their project, in the amount of 37,250. Patrolman Hope Barina handled the 
report, which is pending further investigation.  
 
25MN19927- Fraud 
 
On Friday, June 13th, 2025 at approximately 5:15 p.m., two Ocean Township 
residents reported that a contractor fraudulently used their deposit for purposes 
not related to their project, in the amount of $65,014. Patrolman Hope Barina 
handled the report which is pending further investigation.  
 

25MN19912 – Fraud 
 
On Friday, June 13th, 2025 at approximately 1:11 p.m., a Manalapan business 
reported that an unknown actor(s) utilized a fraudulent email with the company’s 
President’s name to deceptively get an employee to purchase five $200.00 Apple 
gift cards, causing a total loss of $2,000.00 to the business’s credit card account. 
Patrolman Jake Mann took the initial report.  
 
 
25MN19674- Fraud 
 
On Wednesday, June 11th, 2025 at approximately 5:10 p.m., a 61-year-old 
Manalapan resident advised that they were deceived by unknown actor(s). The 
unknown actor(s) were able to transfer $5,000.00 from their personal bank 
account. This report was handled by Patrolman Matthew Jastrzembski.  


